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ACADEMIC WORKSHOP AND CONFERENCES 

Dr. E. Viswanathan

Has actively participated in a specialized program on  Preparation of Research Grants
Proposal  in Social  Studies organized by the Internal  Quality Assurance Cell  (IQAC)  at
DBJC. The program, held from December 12th to December 17th, 2022, was designed
to enhance the skills required for drafting effective research grant proposals. 

Dr. C. Mekkal Roy

Has participated in the Preparation of Research Grants Proposal in Social Studies program,
conducted by the Internal Quality Assurance Cell (IQAC) at DBJC from December 12th to
December  17th,  2022.  This  initiative  was  aimed at  equipping participants  with  the
essential knowledge and skills for developing compelling research grant proposals in
the field of social  studies. Additionally,  also participated in a workshop on  Research
Methodology held at S.A. College on March 3, 2023. This workshop provided essential
knowledge on various research techniques and methods, including quantitative and
qualitative research, data analysis, and the proper formulation of research proposals.

Dr. K. Gubendiran

Has actively participated in the Preparation of Research Grants Proposal in Social Studies
program held from December 12th to December 17th, 2022, under the auspices of the
Internal  Quality  Assurance  Cell  (IQAC)  at  DBJC.  This  program  aimed  to  provide
participants  with  comprehensive  skills  in  drafting  and  submitting  research  grant
proposals within the social studies domain.

Dr. M. Ezhilarasi

Has  participated  in  the  Preparation  of  Research  Grants  Proposal  in  Social  Studies
workshop conducted from December 12th to December 17th, 2022, organized by the
Internal Quality Assurance Cell (IQAC) at DBJC. This program was designed to enhance
the skills required for drafting and submitting successful research grant proposals in
the field of social studies. 

Dr. C. Parvathy

Has participated in the workshop titled Selection of Scholarly Journals & Web Visibility -
Strategies  and  Techniques,  held  from  February  20th  to  February  28th,  2023.  This
program was organized by  the Internal  Quality  Assurance Cell  (IQAC)  at  DBJC.  The
workshop  focused  on  helping  participants  understand  the  criteria  for  selecting
reputable scholarly journals for publication, as well as enhancing their academic web
visibility through effective strategies. 



Mrs. K.E. Deepa

Has actively participated in a workshop on  Preparation of Research Grants Proposal in
Social Studies conducted by the IQAC, DBJC, from December 12th to December 17th,
2022. This program focused on equipping participants with the necessary skills and
strategies for preparing successful research grant proposals, specifically in the field of
social studies.

Dr.E. Indra Gandhi

Has participated in a workshop on Positive Aspects of Teaching Practices, conducted by
Theivanai Ammal College for Women from February 20th to February 24th, 2023. The
workshop  aimed  to  enhance  educators'  understanding  of  innovative  and  positive
teaching methods, promoting more engaging and effective classroom environments.


